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Number One Diet Program · As Little as $4/Week · Healthy Weight LossAmenities: Great
Menu Options, Delicious Easy Meal Plans, All New Features. Blood Type 0 Food List [Pg. 2]
Ref. b Dr. Peter D'Adamo, Eating Right for your Blood Type CEREALS Highly Beneficial
NONE Neutral Amaranth Barley Buckwheat Cream of Rice Kamut . liquors, cola, diet sodas,
black teas Grains & Pasta → Beneficial – none → Neutral – barley flour, buckwheat, kasha,
artichoke pasta, quinoa, brown, white and wild rice, rye flour, spelt . The Complete Blood Type
O Diet Food List. The blood type diet is a nutritional plan that recommends foods based on
your specific blood type - O, A, B, or AB. It is based on the theory that certain foods react
differently in each blood type. The blood type O diet specifically caters to those with type O
blood. (Beneficial): Essene and Ezekiel bread, Whole foods (wild oats and gentle strength
Coop). (Neutral): Brown rice bread, Fin crisp, Gluten-free bread, Ideal flat bread, Millet, % Rye
bread, Rye crisps, Rye vita, Soy flour bread, Spelt bread, Wasa bread. soda, club wine, red
beer soda, diet seltzer water coffee, regular soda, other tea, green* coffee, decaf tea, black
decaf liquor, distilled tea, black regular soda, cola wine, white Sweetener almond extract
aspartame maltodextrin molasses barley malt maple syrup molasses (blackstrap) corn syrup
rice syrup dextrose stevia fructose sucanat. liquors, cola, diet sodas, black teas Grains &
Pasta → Beneficial – none → Neutral – barley flour, buckwheat, kasha, artichoke pasta,
quinoa, brown, white and wild rice, rye flour, spelt flour → Harmful – bulgur, couscous, durum
flour, gluten, graham and oat flours, soba noodles, semolina pasta, spinach pasta, sprouted
whole wheat. Type O Diet (Foods that are beneficial act like medicine; foods to avoid act like
poison). Meats & Poultry (Beneficial): Beef, Beef (ground), Buffalo, Heart, Lamb, Liver, Mutton,
Veal, Venison. (Neutral): Chicken Cornish hens, Duck, Partridge, Pheasant, Rabbit, Turkey,
Quail. (AVOID): Bacon, Goose, Ham, Pork. Seafood. In his book, EAT RIGHT FOR (4) YOUR
TYPE, Dr. Peter D’Adamo teaches the fundamental relationship between your blood type and
the dietary and lifestyle choices that will help you live at your very best.


